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Regarding update of your submitted Article: AS Agriculture

Dari: agriculture@actascientific.com
Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id
Tanggal: Rabu, 5 September 2018 13.26 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas P Sujalu,

Thank you for submitting your updated manuscript. We also thank you for providing your co-
authors Email address. We will soon get back to you with the further update of your Article.

Thank you once again and have a nice day!
Kind Regards,

Ms. Prerna Deshmukh
Contact: 91-9182824667

From: Akas Pinaringan <pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id>

Sent: 05 September 2018 02:57

To: agriculture@actascientific.com

Subject: Re: Acknowledgement of Article ASAG-18-RA-307: AS Agriculture

Dear Ms Prerna Deskhmukh

Because there is some improvement, then I resubmit paper. In addition I also co-author's e-mail

Dr. Ismail ismail.6913@yahoo.co.id
Marisi Napitupulu, M.Kes marisi@untag-smd.ac.id

Sri Endayani, M.P enda@untag-smd.ac.id

Dr. Akas Yekti Pulihasih akasyektipulihasih@gmail.com

warm regards
Akas P Sujalu

about:blank
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Dari: agriculture@actascientific.com
Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id
Tanggal: Senin, 29 Oktober 2018 20.25 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

Cordial Wishes on behalf of AS Agriculture (ISSN: 2581-365X)!

We are glad to notify you that your valuable article ASAG-18-RA-307 entitled “Monthly Water
Balance Analysis at Palaran District-the Province of East Kalimantan” has been accepted for
publication in AS Agriculture. We are carrying out the galley proof and will soon get back to you
with the PDF of the article.

Please find the attached review comments for your informative Article.

Publishing quality articles from eminent researchers like you is a huge asset for the journal. Your
article is of eminent value that provides novel information to the research community.

We cordially request you to make a payment of only $189.00 (inclusive of all taxes) for online
publication of the article in AS Agriculture.

As the journal is open access, it does not receive funding from any source. So, your valuable
payment helps us a lot to cover the Editorial costs, electronic composition and production,
information system, manuscript management system, electronic archiving, overhead expenses and
administrative costs.

Please make your payment by clicking on Pay Online

Thank you in advance and we foresee your valuable contribution!

Kind Regards,

Ms. Prerna Deshmukh

Contact: 91-9182824667

@ Review Comments_ASAG-18-RA-307.docx
61.4kB

about:blank


http://www.actascientific.com/payonline.php
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Dari: agriculture@actascientific.com
Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id
Tanggal: Selasa, 30 Oktober 2018 13.30 GMT+38

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

Hope you had a good start of week!

Manuscript ID: ASAG-18-RA-307

Title: "Monthly Water Balance Analysis at Palaran District-the Province of East Kalimantan”
Amount: $189 (Including all Taxes)

We refer to your valuable payment with the above-mentioned details towards AS Agriculture. We
understand that the e-mails can sometimes be inadvertently overlooked or not prioritized. We trust
that you will now give this matter appropriate attention and attend to payment within 24 hours. As
we are heading towards the completion of this month(Only Single day left) we are pressurized
from the finance department.

Would be grateful if you could clear this out on your end through the link given below.
www.actascientific.com/payonline.php

Kind Note: Please provide the payment receipt for conformation, if you have done with the
payment.

Eagerly looking forward for your clearance!
Kind Regards,

Ms. Prerna Deshmukh
Contact: 91-9182824667

about:blank
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Regarding your query: ASAG

Dari: agriculture@actascientific.com
Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id
Tanggal: Selasa, 13 November 2018 20.04 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

Thank you for reaching us. I would like to clarify you that your Article already done with galley
proof. Please find the attached PDF of your Article. And your Article was in Article in Press which is
scheduled to release on December 01, 2018.

Meanwhile, Please make your valuable payment of $189 by clicking on
www.actascientific.com/payonline.php

Thank you once again and have a nice day!

Regards,
Ms. Prerna Deshmukh
Contact: 91-9182824667

From: Akas Pinaringan <pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id>
Sent: 13 November 2018 16:45

To: agriculture@actascientific.com

Subject: Re: Reminder for your due

Dear Ms Prerna Deshmukh
I plan that the paper can be published in the next year (2019)

warm regards
Akas P Sujalu

G;I ASAG-02-0258.pdf
320.2kB

about:blank
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Regarding your valuable payment: ASAG

Dari: agriculture@actascientific.com
Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id
Tanggal: Rabu, 14 November 2018 12.36 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

Thank you for your acknowledgement. We will soon get back to you with the modified PDF as per
your request. But please let me know when can I expect your valuable payment for your
informative Article. Kindly do understand us that we have been pressurized from the finance
department.

Hope you understand us and we await for your valuable payment.

Thank you once again and have a nice day!

Regards,

Ms. Prerna Deshmukh

Contact: 91-9182824667

From: Akas Pinaringan <pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id>

Sent: 14 November 2018 04:24

To: agriculture@actascientific.com

Subject: Re: Regarding your query: ASAG

Dear Ms Prerna Deshmukh

Thankyou to Editors the journal of Acta Scientific Agriculture with the publication of mu research
paper. But there are vital erros in the identity of the author's affiliation. Name of college "the
university of 17 Agustus 1945 Samarinda" not "the university of Samarinda"

Thankyou

Warm regards
Akas P ujalu

about:blank
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Dari: agriculture@actascientific.com
Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id
Tanggal: Selasa, 20 November 2018 18.01 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

Thank you for your acknowledgement and we are glad to notify that your eminent article ASAG-
18-RA-307 entitled “"Monthly Water Balance Analysis at Palaran District-the Province of East
Kalimantan” has been published in online in AS Agriculture.

Please give a click on AS Agriculture Articles to view your informative article in online.

Also, please find the attached publication certificate on behalf of AS Agriculture, as a token of
appreciation for your potential paper.

Meanwhile, Please make your valuable payment by clicking on
www.actascientific.com/payonline.php

We look forward to receive your acknowledgement!

Regards,
Ms. Prerna Deshmukh
Contact: 91-9182824667

ASAG-02-0258.png
2.2MB

about:blank
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Online publication of your article ASAG-18-RA-307: ASAG

Dari: agriculture@actascientific.com
Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id
Tanggal: Selasa, 20 November 2018 18.01 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

Thank you for your acknowledgement and we are glad to notify that your eminent article ASAG-
18-RA-307 entitled “"Monthly Water Balance Analysis at Palaran District-the Province of East
Kalimantan” has been published in online in AS Agriculture.

Please give a click on AS Agriculture Articles to view your informative article in online.

Also, please find the attached publication certificate on behalf of AS Agriculture, as a token of
appreciation for your potential paper.

Meanwhile, Please make your valuable payment by clicking on
www.actascientific.com/payonline.php

We look forward to receive your acknowledgement!

Regards,
Ms. Prerna Deshmukh
Contact: 91-9182824667

ASAG-02-0258.png
2.2MB
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/= Sel, 4 Sep 2018 jam 20.24 ¢
Dari:

agriculture@actascientific.corr

Kepada: 'Akas Pinaringan'

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

We heartily thank you for submitting your eminent Research
article towards AS Agriculture. We are here to inform you
that, your article has been accepted for further processing
and is under peer review process.

Article Title: Monthly Water Balance Analysis at Palaran
District-the Province of East Kalimantan

Article Reference ID: ASAG-18-RA-307

Please use the above Article Reference ID number for
further communication regarding the article update. We will
proceed with the further process and get back to you with
the update of your valuable article.

We also kindly request you to provide the e-mail ID’s of co-
authors (Dr. Ismail, Sri Endayani, Marisi Napitupulu, Akas
Yekti Pulihasih) for future requirement.

Thank you once again and have a pleasant day!

Kind Regards,
Ms. Prerna Deshmukh
Contact: 91-9182824667

From: Akas Pinaringan <pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id>
Sent: 03 September 2018 22:28

To: Prerna Deshmukh <agri@actscient.com>

Subject: Re: Publication of your article in subsequent issue
of ASAG

Prerna Deshmukh Q

agriculture@actascientific.com

+ Tambah ke kontak
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